

## Letting of November 17, 2017

At this time and prior to a post-letting review, the following projects are within a reasonable approximation of the Estimate.

|                |                |
|----------------|----------------|
| 1. YES         | 44. YES        |
| 2. YES         | 45. NO         |
| 3. YES         | 46. YES        |
| 4. YES         | 47. YES        |
| 5. YES         | 48. YES        |
| 6. YES         | 49. YES        |
| 7. YES         | 50. NO         |
| <b>8. DEL</b>  | 51. YES        |
| 9. YES         | 52. YES        |
| 10. YES        | 53. YES        |
| 11. YES        | 54. YES        |
| 12. YES        | 55. YES        |
| 13. YES        | 56. YES        |
| 14. YES        | 57. YES        |
| 15. YES        | 58. YES        |
| 16. YES        | 59. YES        |
| <b>17. WDN</b> | 60. YES        |
| 18. YES        | 61. YES        |
| 19. YES        | 62. YES        |
| 20. NO         | 63. NO         |
| 21. NO         | <b>64. DEL</b> |
| 22. YES        | 65. YES        |
| 23. NO         | 66. YES        |
| 24. NO         | 67. YES        |
| <b>25. DEL</b> | 68. YES        |
| 26. YES        | 69. YES        |
| 27. NO         | 70. YES        |
| 28. NO         | 71. YES        |
| 29. YES        | <b>72. DEL</b> |
| 30. YES        | <b>73. WDN</b> |
| 31. YES        | 74. YES        |
| 32. YES        | 75. YES        |
| 33. YES        |                |
| 34. YES        |                |
| 35. YES        |                |
| 36. YES        |                |
| 37. NO         |                |
| 38. NO         |                |
| 39. YES        |                |
| 40. YES        |                |
| 41. YES        |                |
| 42. YES        |                |
| 43. YES        |                |







**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 002

**Contract Number** : 62F42

**District** : 1

**Route** : FAI 90

**Section** : 2017-026BP

**County** : Cook

**Project** :

Contract Description: Cleaning and painting existing steel structures on I-90 at Union Pacific Railroad and METRA Railroad in the city of Chicago.

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 2766 | Civil Coatings and Construction, Inc.   |          |
|      | 1651 West Lincolnway<br>Valparaiso, IN 46385<br>Phone: (219) 531-5300<br>Fax: (219) 531-5301<br>jtsahas@civilcoatings.com | (No Bid) |

|      |  |          |
|------|--|----------|
| 5963 | Three Star Painting, Inc.  |          |
|      | 2880 East 84th Place<br>Merrillville, IN 46410<br>Phone: (219) 947-3021<br>Fax: (219) 947-3031 | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                          |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|--------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 003 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 78392 | <b>District</b> : 9      |
| <b>Route</b> : FAP 782    | <b>Section</b> : 110B-1        | <b>County</b> : Gallatin |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                          |

Contract Description: Replacement of SN 030-7007 carrying IL 1 over an unnamed creek 0.5 miles south of the White/Gallatin County line north of Omaha with a new precast box culvert utilizing weekend road closure.

|             |  |              |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| <b>5347</b> | <b>Scanlon Excavating &amp; Concrete, Inc.</b>   |              |
|             | 630 S 7000 W Road<br>Kankakee, IL 60901<br>PO Box 67<br>Bonfield, IL 60913<br>Phone: (815) 937-956<br>bscanlon@scanlonexcavating.net | \$347,304.00 |

|             |  |              |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| <b>0737</b> | <b>CSD Environmental Services, Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 2220 Yale Blvd<br>Springfield, IL 62703<br>Phone: (217) 522-4085<br>Fax: (217) 522-4087<br>frank@csdenviro.com | \$535,009.28 |

|             |   |          |
|-------------|---|----------|
| <b>0104</b> | <b>Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.</b>   |          |
|             | 18306 Wabash 18 Avenue<br>Allendale, IL 62410<br>Phone: (618) 263-3521<br>Fax: (618) 263-3747<br>agco@allendalegravel.com | (No Bid) |

|             |   |          |
|-------------|---|----------|
| <b>3145</b> | <b>Kieffer Bros. Construction Co., Inc.</b>   |          |
|             | 933 West 3rd Street<br>Mt. Carmel, IL 62863<br>Phone: (618) 262-5108<br>Fax: (618) 263-3215<br>doug@kiefferbros.net | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                       |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|-----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 004 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 78163 | <b>District</b> : 9   |
| <b>Route</b> : FAP 328    | <b>Section</b> : 109B-1        | <b>County</b> : White |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                       |

Contract Description: Replacing SN 097-2007 carrying US 45 over an unnamed stream in Sacramento, 3.7 miles south of IL 14.

|             |  |              |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| <b>5526</b> | <b>Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC</b>   |              |
|             | 7038 Highway 154<br>P.O. Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>PO Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>Phone: (618) 924-1077<br>Fax: (618) 625-6516<br>bdorrihbcllc@hotmail.com | \$465,018.67 |
| <b>0104</b> | <b>Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 18306 Wabash 18 Avenue<br>Allendale, IL 62410<br>Phone: (618) 263-3521<br>Fax: (618) 263-3747<br>agco@allendalegravel.com  | (No Bid)     |
| <b>3145</b> | <b>Kieffer Bros. Construction Co., Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 933 West 3rd Street<br>Mt. Carmel, IL 62863<br>Phone: (618) 262-5108<br>Fax: (618) 263-3215<br>doug@kiefferbros.net  | (No Bid)     |
| <b>5306</b> | <b>Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | PO Box 1555<br>Murphysboro, IL 62966<br>Phone: (618) 687-5500<br>Fax: (618) 684-9341<br>info@samron.com  | (No Bid)     |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.











**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 008 \*\*Deleted\*\*      **Contract Number** : 78470      **District** : 9  
**Route** : FAP 855      **Section** : 9Z(B-1)      **County** : Hamilton  
**Project** :

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of SN 033-0005 carrying IL 14 over a creek in McLeansboro.

**No Electronic Bids**

No Authorized Bidders

(No Bid)

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 009

**Contract Number** : 62F88

**District** : 1

**Route** : Various

**Section** : 2017-053I

**County** : Various

**Project** :

Contract Description: Temporary traffic control setup on various State maintained expressway and arterial routes on a work order basis.

5091 RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc

12225 Disk Drive  
Romeoville, IL 60446  
Phone: (815) 372-2300  
Fax: (815) 372-3233  
bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com

\$2,560,000.00

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.















**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 014

**Contract Number** : 76K93

**District** : 8

**Route** : FAP 805

**Section** : 82-9TS-1

**County** : St. Clair

**Project** :

Contract Description: Installation of traffic signals on IL 161 at the I-64 eastbound ramps.

|      |   |              |
|------|---|--------------|
| 1671 | <p>Electrico Inc.<br/>7706 Wagner Road<br/>Millstadt, IL 62260<br/>Phone: (618) 538-9500<br/>Fax: (618) 538-7878<br/>nrk@htc.net</p>                                  | \$127,678.29 |
| 6537 | <p>Wissehr Electric, Inc.<br/>5801 W State Route 161<br/>Belleville, IL 62223<br/>Phone: (618) 398-7575<br/>Fax: (618) 398-7180<br/>jk@wissehr.com</p>                | \$152,761.05 |
| 0518 | <p>Bodine Electric of Decatur<br/>1845 N 22nd Street<br/>Decatur, IL 62525<br/>PO Box 976<br/>Decatur, IL 62525<br/>Phone: (217) 420-4260<br/>Fax: (217) 420-4296</p> | \$259,768.45 |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 017 **\*\*Withdrawn\*\***      **Contract Number** : 60P66      **District** : 1  
**Route** : FAU 3887      **Section** : S-N-1      **County** : Kane  
**Project** :

Contract Description: Channelization on IL 31 approximately 1,800 feet south of Miller Road north through unincorporated Kane County.

**No Electronic Bids**

No Authorized Bidders

(No Bid)

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                      |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 018 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 62C91 | <b>District</b> : 1  |
| <b>Route</b> : Various    | <b>Section</b> : 2016-0371     | <b>County</b> : Cook |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                      |

Contract Description: Shoulder repair at various locations in the villages of Palos Park, Alsip, Crestwood, Lemont, Mount Prospect, Barrington, Barrington Hills, Hinsdale, Lynwood and Streamwood.

|      |  |              |
|------|--|--------------|
| 1320 | D. Construction, Inc.  |              |
|      | 1488 So. Broadway<br>Coal City, IL 60416<br>Phone: (815) 634-2555<br>Fax: (815) 634-8748<br>t.hansen@dconstruction.net                 | \$235,686.50 |
| 4741 | Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities   |              |
|      | 23821 66th Ave N<br>Port Byron, IL 61275<br>Phone: (309) 523-3687<br>Fax: (309) 523-3752<br>mdecap@phoenixcorp.org                     | \$347,826.00 |
| 0231 | Arrow Road Construction Co.  |              |
|      | 3401 S. Busse Road<br>Mt. Prospect, IL 60056<br>P.O. Box 334<br>Mt. Prospect, IL 60056<br>Phone: (847) 437-0700<br>Fax: (847) 437-6887 | \$440,109.50 |
| 1950 | Gallagher Asphalt Corporation  |              |
|      | 18100 South Indiana Avenue<br>Thornton, IL 60476<br>Phone: (708) 877-7160<br>Fax: (708) 877-5222<br>jkolmodin@gallagherasphalt.com     | \$442,376.00 |
| 1560 | R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY   |              |
|      | 600 S. LOMBARD RD.<br>ADDISON, IL 60101<br>P. O. BOX 1129<br>ADDISON, IL 60101<br>Phone: (630) 953-1500<br>Fax: (630) 932-0994         | \$566,346.40 |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                       |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|-----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 019 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 72C33 | <b>District</b> : 6   |
| <b>Route</b> : FAS 1773   | <b>Section</b> : 21ACB         | <b>County</b> : Logan |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                       |

Contract Description: Replacement of the bridge carrying Old Route 66 over Kickapoo Creek, 0.3 miles northeast of Lawndale (SN 054-0002).

|             |  |                |
|-------------|--|----------------|
| <b>4757</b> | <b>Plocher Construction Company, Inc.</b>  |                |
|             | 2808 Thole-Plocher Road<br>Highland, IL 62249<br>Phone: (618) 654-9408<br>Fax: (618) 654-6454<br>bids@plocherco.com  | \$2,093,000.00 |
| <b>5672</b> | <b>Stark Excavating, Inc.</b>  |                |
|             | 1805 W Washington St.<br>Bloomington, IL 61701<br>Phone: (309) 828-5034<br>Fax: (309) 829-3897<br>estimating@starkcompanies.com                                    | \$2,157,659.03 |
| <b>1908</b> | <b>Freesen, A Div. of United Contractors Midwest, Inc.</b>   |                |
|             | 3151 Robbins Road<br>Springfield, IL 62704<br>P.O. Box 13420<br>Springfield, IL 62791<br>Phone: (217) 546-6192<br>Fax: (217) 546-1904<br>FI@ucm.biz                | \$2,180,540.21 |
| <b>5310</b> | <b>Sangamo Construction Company</b>  |                |
|             | 2100 East Moffat St<br>Springfield, IL 62702<br>Phone: (217) 544-9871<br>Fax: (217) 544-9873<br>office@sangamo.net   | \$2,191,809.54 |
| <b>1232</b> | <b>County Contractors, Inc</b>   |                |
|             | 1228 East 1350th Street<br>Quincy, IL 62305<br>P.O. Box 3522<br>Quincy, IL 62305<br>Phone: (217) 885-3550<br>Fax: (217) 885-3575<br>chris@countycontractorsinc.com | \$2,222,774.70 |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.















**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 023

**Contract Number** : 72K14

**District** : 6

**Route** : FAP 510

**Section** : (120) BRR

**County** : Hancock

**Project** :

Contract Description: Replacing expansion joints and installing a microsilica overlay on SN 034-0026 carrying IL 96 over Larry Creek, 5.3 miles north of US 136 at Hamilton.

**5737 ST LOUIS BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION CO**

655 Landmark Drive  
Arnold, MO 63010  
Phone: (636) 296-3300  
Fax: (636) 296-7416

(No Bid)

**5832 Sumit Construction Co., Inc**

4150 W. Wrightwood Ave  
Chicago, IL 60639  
Phone: (773) 276-4600  
Fax: (773) 276-4644

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 025 \*\*Deleted\*\*      **Contract Number** : 78590      **District** : 9  
**Route** : FAP 869; FAP 881      **Section** : D9 TREE PRUNING 2018-1      **County** : Saline  
**Project** :

Contract Description: 16 miles of tree pruning along IL 34 and US 45.

**No Electronic Bids**

No Authorized Bidders

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                       |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|-----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 026 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 78591 | <b>District</b> : 9   |
| <b>Route</b> : FAP 322    | <b>Section</b> : 7B-1          | <b>County</b> : Perry |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                       |

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of SN 073-7010 on US 51, North of Tamaroa, approximately 0.2 miles North of Raven Road.

|             |   |                    |
|-------------|---|--------------------|
| <b>2273</b> | <b>Haier Plumbing &amp; Heating, Inc</b>  |                    |
|             | 301 N. Elkton St.<br>Okawville, IL 62271<br>PO Box 400<br>Okawville, IL 62271<br>Phone: (618) 243-5908<br>Fax: (618) 243-5900 | <b>\$60,825.30</b> |

|             |  |                    |
|-------------|--|--------------------|
| <b>5550</b> | <b>E.T. Simonds Construction Company</b>   |                    |
|             | 1500 N Oakland Ave<br>PO Box 2107<br>Carbondale, IL 62902<br>PO Box 2107<br>Carbondale, IL 62902<br>Phone: (618) 457-8191<br>Fax: (618) 549-0131<br>jjones@etsimonds.com | <b>\$70,513.73</b> |

|             |  |                    |
|-------------|--|--------------------|
| <b>5802</b> | <b>Stutz Excavating, Inc.</b>                                    |                    |
|             | 3837 Fosterburg Road<br>Alton, IL 62002<br>Phone: (618) 259-2485 | <b>\$74,047.50</b> |

|             |   |                    |
|-------------|---|--------------------|
| <b>2308</b> | <b>Hank's Excavating &amp; Landscaping, Inc.</b>  |                    |
|             | 5825 West State Route 161<br>Belleville, IL 62223<br>Phone: (618) 398-5556<br>Fax: (618) 398-2729 | <b>\$79,251.60</b> |

|             |   |                    |
|-------------|---|--------------------|
| <b>5526</b> | <b>Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC</b>  |                    |
|             | 7038 Highway 154<br>P.O. Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>PO Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>Phone: (618) 924-1077<br>Fax: (618) 625-6516<br>bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com | <b>\$84,167.61</b> |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

Letting Item : 026 Contract Number : 78591 District : 9  
Route : FAP 322 Section : 7B-1 County : Perry  
Project :

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of SN 073-7010 on US 51, North of Tamaroa, approximately 0.2 miles North of Raven Road.

|      |  |             |
|------|--|-------------|
| 4741 | Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities<br>23821 66th Ave N<br>Port Byron, IL 61275<br>Phone: (309) 523-3687<br>Fax: (309) 523-3752<br>mdecap@phoenixcorp.org                                       | \$97,369.00 |
| 3085 | Keeley & Sons, INC<br>6303 Collinsville Road<br>East St. Louis, IL 62201<br>PO Box 837<br>East St. Louis, IL 62203<br>Phone: (618) 271-7470<br>Fax: (618) 271-0830<br>dmatthews@keeleyandsons.com  | (No Bid)    |
| 3157 | The Kilian Corporation<br>608 South Independence Street<br>Mascoutah, IL 62258<br>P.O. Box A<br>Mascoutah, IL 62258<br>Phone: (618) 566-2000<br>Fax: (618) 566-2314<br>sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com | (No Bid)    |
| 5306 | Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.<br>PO Box 1555<br>Murphysboro, IL 62966<br>Phone: (618) 687-5500<br>Fax: (618) 684-9341<br>info@samron.com  | (No Bid)    |
| 5347 | Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.<br>630 S 7000 W Road<br>Kankakee, IL 60901<br>PO Box 67<br>Bonfield, IL 60913<br>Phone: (815) 937-956<br>bscanlon@scanlonexcavating.net                        | (No Bid)    |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 026

**Contract Number** : 78591

**District** : 9

**Route** : FAP 322

**Section** : 7B-1

**County** : Perry

**Project** :

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of SN 073-7010 on US 51, North of Tamaroa, approximately 0.2 miles North of Raven Road.

5564 G.M. SIPES CONSTRUCTION, INC.

503 E. ADAMS ST  
RUSHVILLE, IL 62681  
P.O. BOX 109  
RUSHVILLE, IL 62681  
Phone: (217) 322-6543  
Fax: (217) 322-4712  
support@gmsipes.com

(No Bid)

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 027

**Contract Number** : 74664

**District** : 7

**Route** : FAI 70

**Section** : (25-1,2)R

**County** : Effingham

**Project** :

Contract Description: 8 miles of rubbilization/overlay, culvert extension, wing wall repair and ramp repair on I-70 from the Altamont interchange to the Little Wabash River in Effingham.

|      |   |                 |
|------|---|-----------------|
| 2692 | Howell Paving, Inc.<br>1020 N. 13th Street<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>P.O. Box 1009<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>Phone: (217) 234-8877<br>Fax: (217) 234-4226<br>estimates@howellco.com | \$53,150,431.23 |
|------|---|-----------------|

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.















**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 030

**Contract Number** : 62F38

**District** : 1

**Route** : FAI 94

**Section** : 2017-019I

**County** : Cook

**Project** :

Contract Description: Bridge substructure concrete repairs carrying I-94 at Glenview Road and Lincoln Avenue.

6272 Vixen Construction, Inc.

7600 W. 79th Street  
Bridgeview, IL 60455  
Phone: (708) 728-1950  
Fax: (708) 728-1960

(No Bid)



















**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 035

**Contract Number** : 76K21

**District** : 8

**Route** : FAP 817

**Section** : 421BDR-2

**County** : St. Clair

**Project** :

Contract Description: Bridge repairs to SN 082-0078 carrying IL 4 / IL 15 over the Kaskaskia Overflow east of Fayetteville.

3163 Kinney Contractors, Inc.

19342 E. Frontage Rd.  
Raymond, IL 62560  
Phone: (217) 229-3322  
Fax: (217) 229-3609  
kinney@roadbuilder.net

(No Bid)

























**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                      |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 042 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 68D92 | <b>District</b> : 4  |
| <b>Route</b> : FAP 313    | <b>Section</b> : (21-HB-1)BRR  | <b>County</b> : Knox |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                      |

Contract Description: Beam replacement on SN 048-0068 carrying Lincoln Park Drive over US 34 in Galesburg.

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 1045 | Civil Constructors, Inc<br>2283 Bus Hwy 20 East<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>PO Box 750<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>Phone: (815) 235-2200<br>Fax: (815) 235-2219<br>civilestimating@civilinc.com     | (No Bid) |
| 1232 | County Contractors, Inc<br>1228 East 1350th Street<br>Quincy, IL 62305<br>P.O. Box 3522<br>Quincy, IL 62305<br>Phone: (217) 885-3550<br>Fax: (217) 885-3575<br>chris@countycontractorsinc.com | (No Bid) |
| 3391 | Laverdiere Construction, Inc.<br>4055 W Jackson St<br>Macomb, IL 61455<br>Phone: (309) 837-1258<br>Fax: (309) 833-4993<br>mlynn@lavconinc.com   | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 043

**Contract Number** : 68D93

**District** : 4

**Route** : FAI 74

**Section** : 90-14HB-1(BR)ÙBRR

**County** : Tazewell

**Project** :

Contract Description: Beam replacement on SN 090-0091 carrying Pinecrest Drive over I-74 in East Peoria.

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 3391 | Laverdiere Construction, Inc.<br>4055 W Jackson St<br>Macomb, IL 61455<br>Phone: (309) 837-1258<br>Fax: (309) 833-4993<br>mlynn@lavconinc.com             | (No Bid) |
| 5310 | Sangamo Construction Company<br>2100 East Moffat St<br>Springfield, IL 62702<br>Phone: (217) 544-9871<br>Fax: (217) 544-9873<br>office@sangamo.net        | (No Bid) |
| 5672 | Stark Excavating, Inc.<br>1805 W Washington St.<br>Bloomington, IL 61701<br>Phone: (309) 828-5034<br>Fax: (309) 829-3897<br>estimating@starkcompanies.com | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                   |                      |
|---------------------------|-----------------------------------|----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 045 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 68084    | <b>District</b> : 4  |
| <b>Route</b> : FAI 74     | <b>Section</b> : 48(24B)BR, BR-1U | <b>County</b> : Knox |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                  |                      |

Contract Description: Eastbound and Westbound structures carrying I-74 over Pope Creek approximately 1.0 miles south of the Henry County line.

|             |  |                |
|-------------|--|----------------|
| <b>2323</b> | Halverson Construction Co., Inc.   |                |
|             | 620 N. 19th St.<br>Springfield, IL 62702<br>Phone: (217) 753-0027<br>Fax: (217) 753-1904   | \$3,740,419.74 |
|             |  |                |
| <b>1045</b> | Civil Constructors, Inc  |                |
|             | 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>PO Box 750<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>Phone: (815) 235-2200<br>Fax: (815) 235-2219<br>civilestimating@civilinc.com | \$3,879,289.93 |
|             |  |                |
| <b>0593</b> | Brandt Construction Co   |                |
|             | 700 4th Street West<br>Milan, IL 61264<br>Phone: (309) 787-4644<br>Fax: (309) 787-6344<br>tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com                                     | \$3,885,401.30 |
|             |  |                |
| <b>2242</b> | Gunther Construction, A Div. of United Contractors Midwest, Inc.   |                |
|             | 600 East Main Street<br>Galesburg, IL 61401<br>P.O. Box 1488<br>Galesburg, IL 61402<br>Phone: (309) 342-4155<br>Fax: (309) 342-4150<br>Gunther@ucm.biz         | \$4,164,595.51 |
|             |  |                |
| <b>0335</b> | Otto Baum Company, Inc.  |                |
|             | 866 N. Main Street<br>Morton, IL 61550<br>Phone: (309) 266-7114<br>Fax: (309) 263-1050   | (No Bid)       |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

























**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                 |                      |
|---------------------------|---------------------------------|----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 052 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 61D16  | <b>District</b> : 1  |
| <b>Route</b> : FAU 2298   | <b>Section</b> : 13-00215-30-PV | <b>County</b> : Kane |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                |                      |

Contract Description: Constructing a new section of roadway for the Longmeadow Parkway Corridor; project begins at Illinois Route 62 and extends West for 0.46 miles and the reconstruction of Illinois Route 62 from North of Autumn Trail to South of Reagan Boulevard. The project is located along the new Longmeadow Parkway in the Villages of Carpentersville and Barrington Hills in Kane County.

|             |   |                 |
|-------------|---|-----------------|
| <b>3702</b> | <b>Martam Construction, Inc.</b>  |                 |
|             | 1200 Gasket Dr<br>Elgin, IL 60120<br>Phone: (847) 608-6800<br>Fax: (847) 608-6804 | \$10,369,792.32 |

|             |  |                 |
|-------------|--|-----------------|
| <b>3042</b> | <b>Judlau Contracting Inc.</b>   |                 |
|             | 1011 Warrenville Road<br>Suite 195<br>Lisle, IL 60532<br>Suite 195<br>Phone: (630) 568-6640<br>Fax: (331) 777-5771 | \$11,289,818.42 |

|             |  |                 |
|-------------|--|-----------------|
| <b>0382</b> | <b>ACURA INC.</b>  |                 |
|             | 556 COUNTY LINE ROAD<br>BENSENVILLE, IL 60106<br>Phone: (630) 766-9979<br>Fax: (630) 766-6826<br>Estimating@acurainc.com | \$11,733,139.57 |

|             |   |          |
|-------------|---|----------|
| <b>0103</b> | <b>Alliance Contractors, Inc.</b>   |          |
|             | 1166 Lake Avenue<br>Woodstock, IL 60098<br>Phone: (815) 338-5900<br>Fax: (815) 338-9109 | (No Bid) |

|             |   |          |
|-------------|---|----------|
| <b>0362</b> | <b>Benchmark Construction Co., Inc.</b>   |          |
|             | 2260 Southwind Blvd<br>Bartlett, IL 60103<br>Phone: (630) 497-1700<br>Fax: (630) 497-1737 | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 052

**Contract Number** : 61D16

**District** : 1

**Route** : FAU 2298

**Section** : 13-00215-30-PV

**County** : Kane

**Project** :

Contract Description: Constructing a new section of roadway for the Longmeadow Parkway Corridor; project begins at Illinois Route 62 and extends West for 0.46 miles and the reconstruction of Illinois Route 62 from North of Autumn Trail to South of Reagan Boulevard. The project is located along the new Longmeadow Parkway in the Villages of Carpentersville and Barrington Hills in Kane County.

6344 Walsh Construction Company II,LLC

929 West Adams Street  
Chicago, IL 60607  
Phone: (312) 563-5400  
Fax: (312) 563-5447

(No Bid)

















**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                 |                           |
|---------------------------|---------------------------------|---------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 057 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 91528  | <b>District</b> : 5       |
| <b>Route</b> : TR 274     | <b>Section</b> : 09-03138-00-BR | <b>County</b> : Vermilion |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                |                           |

Contract Description: Bridge replacement 2 miles northwest of Vermilion Grove over Little Vermilion River.

|   |              |
|---|--------------|
| 647 Newell Lane<br>Danville, IL 61832<br>PO Box 1097<br>Danville, IL 61834<br>Phone: (217) 443-3370<br>Fax: (217) 443-3012<br>sondrabroke@gmail.com | \$626,311.32 |
|---|--------------|









**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 060

**Contract Number** : 97658

**District** : 8

**Route** : FAU 9177

**Section** : 14-00017-00-BT (SHILOH)

**County** : St. Clair

**Project** :

Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use path along Seibert Road from Southridge Drive to Johnson Road in the Village of Shiloh.

5802 Stutz Excavating, Inc.  
3837 Fosterburg Road  
Alton, IL 62002  
Phone: (618) 259-2485

(No Bid)

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                 |                      |
|---------------------------|---------------------------------|----------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 061 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 61A77  | <b>District</b> : 1  |
| <b>Route</b> : FAS 97     | <b>Section</b> : 08-00024-01-BR | <b>County</b> : Kane |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                |                      |

Contract Description: Bridge replacement and roadway reconstruction on FAS Route 97 (West County Line Road) over Union Ditch No. 3, located 1.5 miles north of Maple Park.

|             |   |                       |
|-------------|---|-----------------------|
| <b>1320</b> | <b>D. Construction, Inc.</b>  |                       |
|             | 1488 So. Broadway<br>Coal City, IL 60416<br>Phone: (815) 634-2555<br>Fax: (815) 634-8748<br>t.hansen@dconstruction.net              | <b>\$1,563,385.95</b> |
| <b>1552</b> | <b>Dunnet Bay Construction Company</b>  |                       |
|             | 115 N. Brandon Drive<br>Glendale Heights, IL 60139<br>Phone: (630) 539-1200<br>Fax: (630) 539-4171<br>estimating@dunnetbay.net      | <b>\$1,671,325.14</b> |
| <b>3706</b> | <b>Martin &amp; Company Excavating</b>  |                       |
|             | 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Road<br>Oregon, IL 61061<br>P.O. Box 443<br>Oregon, IL 61061<br>Phone: (815) 732-2422<br>Fax: (815) 732-2092 | <b>\$1,689,663.96</b> |
| <b>2520</b> | <b>HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY</b>  |                       |
|             | 1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE<br>ROMEDEVILLE, IL 60446<br>Phone: (630) 378-1000<br>Fax: (630) 378-1002<br>becky@hmcco.net                    | <b>\$1,733,122.39</b> |
| <b>0204</b> | <b>Areatha Construction Co., Inc.</b>   |                       |
|             | 410 E. North Avenue<br>Streamwood, IL 60107<br>Phone: (630) 830-9853<br>Fax: (630) 830-9856   | <b>\$1,777,569.85</b> |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 061

**Contract Number** : 61A77

**District** : 1

**Route** : FAS 97

**Section** : 08-00024-01-BR

**County** : Kane

**Project** :

Contract Description: Bridge replacement and roadway reconstruction on FAS Route 97 (West County Line Road) over Union Ditch No. 3, located 1.5 miles north of Maple Park.

3505 Lorig Construction Company

250 East Touhy Avenue  
Des Plaines, IL 60018  
Phone: (847) 298-0360  
Fax: (847) 298-2689  
dlorig@flash.net

(No Bid)

5570 Sjostrom & Sons, Inc

1129 Harrison Ave.  
Rockford, IL 61104  
PO Box 5766  
Rockford, IL 61125  
Phone: (815) 226-0330  
Fax: (815) 226-8868

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                             |   |                         |
|-----------------------------|---|-------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 062   | <b>Contract Number</b> : 61E04                | <b>District</b> : 1     |
| <b>Route</b> : JUSTEN; ROAD | <b>Section</b> : 13-00009-00-BR PRAIRIE GROVE | <b>County</b> : McHenry |
|                             | <b>Project</b> :                              |                         |

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying Justen Road over Fox River Tributary, located 0.50 miles north of Wright Street in the Village of Prairie Grove.

|             |   |              |
|-------------|---|--------------|
| <b>0204</b> | <b>Areatha Construction Co., Inc.</b>   |              |
|             | 410 E. North Avenue<br>Streamwood, IL 60107<br>Phone: (630) 830-9853<br>Fax: (630) 830-9856 | \$939,932.70 |

|             |  |          |
|-------------|--|----------|
| <b>1045</b> | <b>Civil Constructors, Inc</b>   |          |
|             | 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>PO Box 750<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>Phone: (815) 235-2200<br>Fax: (815) 235-2219<br>civilestimating@civilinc.com | (No Bid) |

|             |  |          |
|-------------|--|----------|
| <b>2520</b> | <b>HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY</b>   |          |
|             | 1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE<br>ROMEDEVILLE, IL 60446<br>Phone: (630) 378-1000<br>Fax: (630) 378-1002<br>becky@hmcco.net | (No Bid) |

|             |  |          |
|-------------|--|----------|
| <b>4399</b> | <b>Norvilla, LLC</b>   |          |
|             | 2701 S. 13th Avenue<br>Broadview, IL 60155<br>Phone: (708) 223-8151<br>Fax: (708) 223-4384<br>lvgalvani@norvillaconstruction.com | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 064 \*\*Deleted\*\*      **Contract Number** : 89681      **District** : 4  
**Route** : FAU 6765      **Section** : 14-00190-00-SP (PEKIN)      **County** : Tazewell  
**Project** :

Contract Description: Vertical and horizontal realignment east of Court Street for 0.21 miles in the city of Pekin.

**No Electronic Bids**

No Authorized Bidders

(No Bid)







**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                 |                         |
|---------------------------|---------------------------------|-------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 066 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 61D64  | <b>District</b> : 1     |
| <b>Route</b> : FAU 186    | <b>Section</b> : 14-00438-00-BR | <b>County</b> : McHenry |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                |                         |

Contract Description: Structure rehabilitation and pavement reconstruction on FAU Route 186 (Bay Road) over Lily Lake Drain, located 1.0 mile southeast of Chapel Hill Road.

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 1045 | Civil Constructors, Inc<br>2283 Bus Hwy 20 East<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>PO Box 750<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>Phone: (815) 235-2200<br>Fax: (815) 235-2219<br>civilestimating@civilinc.com | (No Bid) |
| 2520 | HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY<br>1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE<br>ROMEDEVILLE, IL 60446<br>Phone: (630) 378-1000<br>Fax: (630) 378-1002<br>becky@hmcco.net   | (No Bid) |
| 3494 | Lorusso Cement Contractors, INC.<br>1090 Carolina Drive<br>West Chicago, IL 60185<br>Phone: (630) 231-9009<br>Fax: (630) 231-9083   | (No Bid) |
| 3505 | Lorig Construction Company<br>250 East Touhy Avenue<br>Des Plaines, IL 60018<br>Phone: (847) 298-0360<br>Fax: (847) 298-2689<br>dlorig@flash.net  | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.







**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                 |                         |
|---------------------------|---------------------------------|-------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 068 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 97660  | <b>District</b> : 8     |
| <b>Route</b> : FAS 756    | <b>Section</b> : 15-00052-05-PV | <b>County</b> : Calhoun |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :                |                         |

Contract Description: Reconstruction of Batchtown Road from 1.4 miles west of the intersection of CH6 and CH1 to 1.2 miles west of the intersection of CH6 and CH1.

|      |  |              |
|------|--|--------------|
| 5802 | Stutz Excavating, Inc.   |              |
|      | 3837 Fosterburg Road<br>Alton, IL 62002<br>Phone: (618) 259-2485 | \$927,201.83 |

|      |  |                |
|------|--|----------------|
| 2825 | Illinois Valley Paving, A Div. of United Contractors Midwest, Inc.   |                |
|      | 3151 Robbins Road<br>Springfield, IL 62704<br>P.O. Box 13420<br>Springfield, IL 62791<br>Phone: (217) 546-6192<br>Fax: (217) 546-1904<br>IVP@ucm.biz | \$1,436,261.48 |

|      |  |                |
|------|--|----------------|
| 4928 | RCS Construction, Inc.   |                |
|      | 960 E. Airline Drive<br>East Alton, IL 62024<br>Phone: (618) 254-3816<br>Fax: (618) 254-3841<br>julie@rcs-construction.com | \$1,600,000.00 |

|      |  |          |
|------|--|----------|
| 0338 | Baxmeyer Construction Inc.   |          |
|      | 1034 Floraville Road<br>Waterloo, IL 62298<br>Phone: (618) 939-3000<br>Fax: (618) 939-4299 | (No Bid) |

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 2308 | Hank's Excavating & Landscaping, Inc.   |          |
|      | 5825 West State Route 161<br>Belleville, IL 62223<br>Phone: (618) 398-5556<br>Fax: (618) 398-2729 | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.



**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                        |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 069 | <b>Contract Number</b> : 66C57 | <b>District</b> : 3    |
| <b>Route</b> : FAS 2247   | <b>Section</b> : 12C           | <b>County</b> : Bureau |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                        |

Contract Description: Removing and replacing existing SN 006-2580 with a 9'x8' cast-in-place concrete box culvert SN 006-2600 approximately 1 mile west of I-180 in Bureau County.

|             |  |              |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| <b>1320</b> | <b>D. Construction, Inc.</b>   |              |
|             | 1488 So. Broadway<br>Coal City, IL 60416<br>Phone: (815) 634-2555<br>Fax: (815) 634-8748<br>t.hansen@dconstruction.net   | \$460,431.22 |
| <b>5672</b> | <b>Stark Excavating, Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 1805 W Washington St.<br>Bloomington, IL 61701<br>Phone: (309) 828-5034<br>Fax: (309) 829-3897<br>estimating@starkcompanies.com                                | \$519,061.70 |
| <b>4741</b> | <b>Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities</b>  |              |
|             | 23821 66th Ave N<br>Port Byron, IL 61275<br>Phone: (309) 523-3687<br>Fax: (309) 523-3752<br>mdecap@phoenixcorp.org   | \$603,473.00 |
| <b>1045</b> | <b>Civil Constructors, Inc</b>   |              |
|             | 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>PO Box 750<br>Freeport, IL 61032<br>Phone: (815) 235-2200<br>Fax: (815) 235-2219<br>civilestimating@civilinc.com | \$623,018.29 |
| <b>0593</b> | <b>Brandt Construction Co</b>  |              |
|             | 700 4th Street West<br>Milan, IL 61264<br>Phone: (309) 787-4644<br>Fax: (309) 787-6344<br>tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com                                     | \$688,117.05 |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.













**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 071

**Contract Number** : 61E05

**District** : 1

**Route** : FAU 2298

**Section** : 16-00215-11-PV

**County** : Kane

**Project** :

Contract Description: New roadway construction, roadway reconstruction, resurfacing, box culverts, retaining walls, storm sewer, traffic signals, roadway lighting and the construction of a structure to carry Longmeadow Parkway over Illinois Route 31. Project is located west of Karen Drive to east of Illinois Route 31.

6344 Walsh Construction Company II,LLC

929 West Adams Street  
Chicago, IL 60607  
Phone: (312) 563-5400  
Fax: (312) 563-5447

(No Bid)

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 072 \*\*Deleted\*\*      **Contract Number** : 64L35      **District** : 2  
**Route** : FAP 599      **Section** : (83MFT)DM      **County** : Rock Island  
**Project** :

Contract Description: Demolition and removal of building(s) adjacent to IL 92 located 0.3 mile north of Brights Court.

**No Electronic Bids**

No Authorized Bidders

(No Bid)









**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 074                      **Contract Number** : 60V57                      **District** : 1  
**Route** : FAP 345                      **Section** : 7K-1(12)                      **County** : Cook  
**Project** :

Contract Description: Roadway reconstruction, ramp modification, construction of a new ramp, retaining and noise walls, rehabilitation of the bridge structure carrying US 20 over IL 59, sidewalk and shared-use path and aesthetic landscaping in the villages of Bartlett and Streamwood.

3885      James McHugh Construction Co.  
1737 S. Michigan Avenue  
Chicago, IL 60616                      (No Bid)  
Phone: (312) 986-8000  
Fax: (312) 896-9056

6344      Walsh Construction Company II,LLC  
929 West Adams Street  
Chicago, IL 60607                      (No Bid)  
Phone: (312) 563-5400  
Fax: (312) 563-5447

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.









**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |   |                           |
|---------------------------|---|---------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 02A | <b>Contract Number</b> : EF008                | <b>District</b> : 7       |
| <b>Route</b> :            | <b>Section</b> : EFFINGHAM COUNTY<br>MEMORIAL | <b>County</b> : Effingham |
|                           | <b>Project</b> : 211                          |                           |

Contract Description: Obstruction Removal: Runways 11-29 and 1-19

|      |   |              |
|------|---|--------------|
| 6310 | A. J. Walker Construction Company   |              |
|      | 421 S. 21st Street<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>PO Box 118<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>Phone: (217) 235-5647<br>Fax: (217) 235-5939<br>ajwalker@consolidated.net | \$188,583.79 |
|      |   |              |
| 2661 | Homer Tree Service, Inc.  |              |
|      | 14000 S. Archer Ave.<br>Lockport , IL 60441<br>Phone: (815) 838-0320<br>Fax: (815) 838-6027   | \$202,555.00 |
|      |   |              |
| 1093 | Clean Cut Tree Service, Inc.  |              |
|      | 31064 N IL Route 83<br>Grayslake, IL 60030<br>Phone: (847) 265-0000<br>Fax: (847) 265-0005  | \$216,390.00 |
|      |   |              |
| 4456 | Oak Hill Contractors LLC  |              |
|      | 21434 Oak Hill Rd.<br>Ewing, IL 62836   | \$246,338.47 |
|      |   |              |
| 3145 | Kieffer Bros. Construction Co., Inc.  |              |
|      | 933 West 3rd Street<br>Mt. Carmel, IL 62863<br>Phone: (618) 262-5108<br>Fax: (618) 263-3215<br>doug@kiefferbros.net                                     | \$248,920.00 |
|      |   |              |
| 5802 | Stutz Excavating, Inc.  |              |
|      | 3837 Fosterburg Road<br>Alton, IL 62002<br>Phone: (618) 259-2485  | \$250,457.50 |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |   |                           |
|---------------------------|---|---------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 02A | <b>Contract Number</b> : EF008                | <b>District</b> : 7       |
| <b>Route</b> :            | <b>Section</b> : EFFINGHAM COUNTY<br>MEMORIAL | <b>County</b> : Effingham |
|                           | <b>Project</b> : 211                          |                           |

Contract Description: Obstruction Removal: Runways 11-29 and 1-19

|             |  |              |
|-------------|--|--------------|
| <b>4263</b> | <b>Mott Excavating, Inc.</b>   |              |
|             | 1210 Lake Autumn Lane<br>Vienna, IL 62995<br>PO Box 613<br>Vienna, IL 62995<br>Phone: (618) 658-2605<br>Fax: (618) 658-3214<br>mottexc@yahoo.com                   | \$266,150.00 |
| <b>4832</b> | <b>Prado Construction</b>  |              |
|             | 1875 Weil Road<br>Troy, IL 62294<br>Phone: (618) 667-9375<br>Fax: (618) 667-9375   | \$278,449.78 |
| <b>5526</b> | <b>Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC</b>   |              |
|             | 7038 Highway 154<br>P.O. Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>PO Box 130<br>Sesser, IL 62884<br>Phone: (618) 924-1077<br>Fax: (618) 625-6516<br>bdorribsbllc@hotmail.com | \$287,479.39 |
| <b>0737</b> | <b>CSD Environmental Services, Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 2220 Yale Blvd<br>Springfield, IL 62703<br>Phone: (217) 522-4085<br>Fax: (217) 522-4087<br>frank@csdenviro.com   | \$310,515.95 |
| <b>0104</b> | <b>Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.</b>  |              |
|             | 18306 Wabash 18 Avenue<br>Allendale, IL 62410<br>Phone: (618) 263-3521<br>Fax: (618) 263-3747<br>agco@allendalegravel.com  | (No Bid)     |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

Letting Item : 02A

Contract Number : EF008

District : 7

Route :

Section : EFFINGHAM COUNTY  
MEMORIAL

County : Effingham

Project : 211

Contract Description: Obstruction Removal: Runways 11-29 and 1-19

2308 Hank's Excavating & Landscaping, Inc.  
5825 West State Route 161  
Belleville, IL 62223 (No Bid)  
Phone: (618) 398-5556  
Fax: (618) 398-2729

3163 Kinney Contractors, Inc.  
19342 E. Frontage Rd.  
Raymond, IL 62560 (No Bid)  
Phone: (217) 229-3322  
Fax: (217) 229-3609  
kinney@roadbuilder.net

3172 John J. Klein d/b/a Klein Excavating  
387 N. 1600E Rd.  
Pana, IL 62557 (No Bid)  
Phone: (217) 820-0646  
Fax: (217) 568-6221  
kleinexcavating58@hotmail.com

4373 Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.  
320 Ottawa Street  
Morris, IL 60450 (No Bid)  
1201 Fremont Ave  
Morris, IL 60450  
Phone: (815) 693-9763  
nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

|                           |                                |                         |
|---------------------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------|
| <b>Letting Item</b> : 1LR | <b>Contract Number</b> : M1707 | <b>District</b> :       |
| <b>Route</b> :            | <b>Section</b> :               | <b>County</b> : Various |
|                           | <b>Project</b> :               |                         |

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Cupi Mine Group abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

|      |  |  |
|------|--|--|
| 1908 | Freesen, A Div. of United Contractors Midwest, Inc.<br><br>3151 Robbins Road<br>Springfield, IL 62704<br>P.O. Box 13420<br>Springfield, IL 62791<br>Phone: (217) 546-6192<br>Fax: (217) 546-1904<br>FI@ucm.biz | <div style="border: 1px solid black; padding: 5px; width: fit-content;">\$164,676.38</div> |
| 4122 | Miller and Son Construction Co.<br><br>307 W. First St.<br>Mackinaw, IL 61755<br>PO Box 289<br>Mackinaw, IL 61755<br>Phone: (309) 359-8066<br>Fax: (309) 359-8653<br>dmjvmiller@yahoo.com                      | \$172,706.00   |
| 5672 | Stark Excavating, Inc.<br><br>1805 W Washington St.<br>Bloomington, IL 61701<br>Phone: (309) 828-5034<br>Fax: (309) 829-3897<br>estimating@starkcompanies.com  | \$174,600.00   |
| 2055 | Gibbs Construction<br><br>211 East Pine Street<br>Modesto, IL 62667<br>PO Box 11<br>Modesto, IL 62667  | \$175,568.00   |
| 0737 | CSD Environmental Services, Inc.<br><br>2220 Yale Blvd<br>Springfield, IL 62703<br>Phone: (217) 522-4085<br>Fax: (217) 522-4087<br>frank@csdenviro.com   | \$211,643.06   |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

Letting Item : 1LR

Contract Number : M1707

District :

Route :

Section :

County : Various

Project :

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Cupi Mine Group abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

2323 Halverson Construction Co., Inc.  
620 N. 19th St.  
Springfield, IL 62702  
Phone: (217) 753-0027  
Fax: (217) 753-1904  
(No Bid)

3172 John J. Klein d/b/a Klein Excavating  
387 N. 1600E Rd.  
Pana, IL 62557  
Phone: (217) 820-0646  
Fax: (217) 568-6221  
kleinexcavating58@hotmail.com  
(No Bid)

4373 Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.  
320 Ottawa Street  
Morris, IL 60450  
1201 Fremont Ave  
Morris, IL 60450  
Phone: (815) 693-9763  
nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com  
(No Bid)

4741 Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities  
23821 66th Ave N  
Port Byron, IL 61275  
Phone: (309) 523-3687  
Fax: (309) 523-3752  
mdecap@phoenixcorp.org  
(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 2LR

**Contract Number** : M1708

**District** :

**Route** :

**Section** :

**County** : Various

**Project** :

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Kickapoo – Dynegy Lake abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds.

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 5672 | <b>Stark Excavating, Inc.</b>   |          |
|      | 1805 W Washington St.<br>Bloomington, IL 61701<br>Phone: (309) 828-5034<br>Fax: (309) 829-3897<br>estimating@starkcompanies.com | (No Bid) |

|      |   |          |
|------|---|----------|
| 6310 | <b>A. J. Walker Construction Company</b>  |          |
|      | 421 S. 21st Street<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>PO Box 118<br>Mattoon, IL 61938<br>Phone: (217) 235-5647<br>Fax: (217) 235-5939<br>ajwalker@consolidated.net | (No Bid) |

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.





**Illinois Department of Transportation  
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids  
For Letting: 11/17/2017**

Run Time 11/17/17 - 10:06 AM

**Letting Item** : 3LR

**Contract Number** : M1709

**District** :

**Route** :

**Section** :

**County** : Various

**Project** :

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Delta Collieries North Phase II abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Land Funds.

5802 Stutz Excavating, Inc.  
3837 Fosterburg Road  
Alton, IL 62002  
Phone: (618) 259-2485

(No Bid)